

**MINUTES OF THE COLORADO COUNTY
COMMISSIONER'S COURT REGULAR MEETING
MARCH 14, 2022**

- _13. Award bid(s) for the purchase of the following for county precincts:
- a. Road paving;
 - b. AC-5 asphalt, AC-10 asphalt, CRS-2 emulsion, MC-30 road oil, and seal coat sealers or proven equal;
 - c. Road materials;
 - d. Herbicides; and
 - e. Culverts.

Motion by Commissioner Gertson to approve awarding the bids for the purchase of the following for county precincts Road Pavings; AC-5 asphalt, AC-10 asphalt, CRS-2 emulsion, MC-30 road oil, and seal coat sealers or proven equal; Road materials; Herbicides; seconded by Commissioner Neuendorff; 5 ayes 0 nays; motion carried, it was so ordered. Discussion followed.

Motion by Commissioner Neuendorff to deny the Culverts bid due to lack of bidders; Raymie Kana, County Auditor advised that we can reject the bid and have a rebid; seconded by Commissioner Kubesch; 5 ayes 0 nays; motion carried, it was so ordered.

(See Attachment)

**MINUTES OF THE COLORADO COUNTY
COMMISSIONER'S COURT REGULAR MEETING
MARCH 14, 2022**

**BID TABULATION FOR CULVERTS
OPENED PUBLICLY MARCH 9, 2022 AT 2:00 P.M.
FOR THE PERIOD APRIL 1, 2022 TO MARCH 31, 2023**

(1) Galvanized Corrugated Steel Pipe (Price per linear foot)

Bidder	Dia	2-2/3x1/2 10 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 12 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 14 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 16 Gage	Delivery Charge
Wilson Culverts	12	NB	NB	\$18.90	\$15.71	No charge
	15	NB	NB	\$23.63	\$19.53	
	18	NB	\$38.93	\$28.31	\$23.40	
	24	NB	\$50.09	\$37.44	\$31.19	
	30	NB	\$62.69	\$46.98	\$39.06	
	36	NB	\$76.28	\$56.25	\$47.25	
	48	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	54	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	60	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	72	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	84	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	96	NB	NB	NB	NB	

Bidder	Dia	2-2/3x1/2 10 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 12 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 14 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 16 Gage	Delivery Charge
Contech Constr	12					
*bid arrived	15					
after 2 pm	18					
	24					
	30					
	36					
	48					
	54					
	60					
	72					
	84					
	96					

**MINUTES OF THE COLORADO COUNTY
COMMISSIONER'S COURT REGULAR MEETING
MARCH 14, 2022**

Bidder	Dia	2-2/3x1/2 10 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 12 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 14 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 16 Gage	Delivery Charge
	12					
	15					
	18					
	24					
	30					
	36					
	48					
	54					
	60					
	72					
	84					
	96					

(2) Galvanized Corrugated Steel Pipe (Price per linear foot)

Bidder	Dia	3x1 or 5x1 10 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 12 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 14 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 16 Gage	Delivery Charge
Wilson Culverts	36	NB	NB	NB	NB	No charge
	48	\$154.80	\$120.92	\$89.60	\$75.06	
	54	\$174.20	\$136.40	\$101.43	\$84.42	
	60	\$193.46	\$149.27	\$110.39	\$92.75	
	72	\$232.20	\$180.23	\$133.43	\$111.24	
	84	\$272.93	\$207.63	\$154.35	NB	
	96	\$309.51	\$238.32	\$175.95	NB	
	108	\$340.02	\$267.57	\$197.06	NB	
	120	\$377.82	\$291.42	NB	NB	
	132	\$415.62	NB	NB	NB	
	144	\$453.42	NB	NB	NB	

Bidder	Dia	3x1 or 5x1 10 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 12 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 14 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 16 Gage	Delivery Charge
Contech Constr	36					
*bid arrived	48					
after 2 pm	54					
	60					

**MINUTES OF THE COLORADO COUNTY
COMMISSIONER'S COURT REGULAR MEETING
MARCH 14, 2022**

72						
84						
96						
108						
120						
132						
144						

Bidder	Dia	3x1 or 5x1 10 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 12 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 14 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 16 Gage	Delivery Charge
	36					
	48					
	54					
	60					
	72					
	84					
	96					
	108					
	120					
	132					
	144					

3. Arched Galvanized Corrugated Steel Pipe (Price per linear foot)

Bidder	Round Inches	Arch Inches	10 Gage	12 Gage	14 Gage	16 Gage	Del.Chg.
Wilson Culverts	15	17x13	NB	NB	\$24.63	\$20.53	None
	18	21x15	NB	\$39.93	\$29.31	\$24.40	
	21	24x18	NB	\$46.18	\$34.03	\$28.27	
	24	28x20	NB	\$51.09	\$38.44	\$32.19	
	30	35x24	NB	\$63.69	\$47.98	\$40.06	
	36	42x29	NB	\$77.28	\$57.25	NB	
	48	53x41	NB	\$122.42	\$91.10	NB	
	54	60x46	NB	\$137.90	\$102.93	NB	
	60	66x51	NB	\$150.77	\$111.89	NB	

**MINUTES OF THE COLORADO COUNTY
COMMISSIONER'S COURT REGULAR MEETING
MARCH 14, 2022**

Bidder	Round Inches	Arch Inches	10 Gage	12 Gage	14 Gage	16 Gage	Del.Chg.
Contech Cons	15	17x13					
*bid arrived	18	21x15					
after 2 pm	21	24x18					
	24	28x20					
	30	35x24					
	36	42x29					
	48	53x41					
	54	60x46					
	60	66x51					

4. Aluminized Corrugated Steel Pipe (Price per linear foot)

Bidder	Dia	2-2/3x1/2 10 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 12 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 14 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 16 Gage	Delivery Charge
Wilson Culverts	12	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	15	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	18	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	24	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	30	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	36	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	48	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	54	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	60	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	72	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	84	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	96	NB	NB	NB	NB	

Bidder	Dia	2-2/3x1/2 10 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 12 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 14 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 16 Gage	Delivery Charge
Contech Constr	12					
*bid arrived	15					
after 2 pm	18					
	24					
	30					
	36					
	48					

**MINUTES OF THE COLORADO COUNTY
COMMISSIONER'S COURT REGULAR MEETING
MARCH 14, 2022**

	54					
	60					
	72					
	84					
	96					

Bidder	Dia	2-2/3x1/2 10 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 12 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 14 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 16 Gage	Delivery Charge
	12					
	15					
	18					
	24					
	30					
	36					
	48					
	54					
	60					
	72					
	84					
	96					

5. Aluminized Corrugated Steel Pipe (Price per linear foot)

Bidder	Dia	3x1 or 5x1 10 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 12 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 14 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 16 Gage	Delivery Charge
Wilson Culverts	36	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	48	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	54	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	60	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	72	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	84	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	96	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	108	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	120	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	132	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	144	NB	NB	NB	NB	

**MINUTES OF THE COLORADO COUNTY
COMMISSIONER'S COURT REGULAR MEETING
MARCH 14, 2022**

Bidder	Dia	3x1 or 5x1 10 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 12 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 14 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 16 Gage	Delivery Charge
Contech Constr	36					
*bid arrived	48					
After 2 pm	54					
	60					
	72					
	84					
	96					
	108					
	120					
	132					
	144					

Bidder	Dia	3x1 or 5x1 10 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 12 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 14 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 16 Gage	Delivery Charge
	36					
	48					
	54					
	60					
	72					
	84					
	96					
	108					
	120					
	132					
	144					

6. Reinforced Concrete Pipe

Bidder	Diameter "Inches"	Price per linear foot	Delivery Charge
Wilson Culvers	12	No bid	
	15	No bid	
	18	No bid	
	24	No bid	

**MINUTES OF THE COLORADO COUNTY
COMMISSIONER'S COURT REGULAR MEETING
MARCH 14, 2022**

	30	No bid	
	36	No bid	
	48	No bid	
	54	No bid	
	60	No bid	
	72	No bid	
	84	No bid	
	96	No bid	

Bidder	Diameter "Inches"	Price per linear foot	Delivery Charge
Contech Construction	12		
*bid received after 2 pm	15		
	18		
	24		
	30		
	36		
	48		
	54		
	60		
	72		
	84		
	96		

Bidder	Diameter "Inches"	Price per linear foot	Delivery Charge
	12		
	15		
	18		
	24		
	30		
	36		
	48		
	54		
	60		
	72		
	84		
	96		

**MINUTES OF THE COLORADO COUNTY
COMMISSIONER'S COURT REGULAR MEETING
MARCH 14, 2022**

7. High Density Polyethylene (HDPE) Pipe

Bidder	Diameter "Inches"	Price per linear foot	Delivery Charge
Wilson Culverts	12	No bid	
	15	No bid	
	18	No bid	
	24	No bid	
	30	No bid	
	36	No bid	
	48	No bid	
	54	No bid	
	60	No bid	

Bidder	Diameter "Inches"	Price per linear foot	Delivery Charge
Contech Construction	12		
*bid arrived after 2 pm	15		
	18		
	24		
	30		
	36		
	48		
	54		
	60		

Bidder	Diameter "Inches"	Price per linear foot	Delivery Charge
	12		
	15		
	18		
	24		
	30		
	36		
	48		
	54		
	60		

**MINUTES OF THE COLORADO COUNTY
COMMISSIONER'S COURT REGULAR MEETING
MARCH 14, 2022**

(8) ARCHED ALUMINIZED CORRUGATED STEEL PIPE

Bidder	Round Inches	Arch Inches	10 Gage	12 Gage	14 Gage	16 Gage	Del.Chg.
Wilson Culverts	15	17x13	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	18	21x15	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	21	24x18	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	24	28x20	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	30	35x24	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	36	42x29	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	48	53x41	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	54	60x46	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	60	66x51	NB	NB	NB	NB	

	Round Inches	Arch Inches	10 Gage	12 Gage	14 Gage	16 Gage	Del.Chg.
Contech Constr	15	17x13					
*bid arrived after 2 pm	18	21x15					
	21	24x18					
	24	28x20					
	30	35x24					
	36	42x29					
	48	53x41					
	54	60x46					
	60	66x51					

Bidder	Round Inches	Arch Inches	10 Gage	12 Gage	14 Gage	16 Gage	Del.Chg.
	15	17x13					
	18	21x15					
	21	24x18					
	24	28x20					
	30	35x24					
	36	42x29					
	48	53x41					

**MINUTES OF THE COLORADO COUNTY
COMMISSIONER'S COURT REGULAR MEETING
MARCH 14, 2022**

	54	60x46					
	60	66x51					