

**MINUTES OF THE COLORADO COUNTY  
COMMISSIONER'S COURT REGULAR MEETING**

**April 11, 2022**

\_\_7. Award bid(s) for culverts for county precincts.

**Motion by Commissioner Wessels to accept bids for culverts for County Precincts based on price, availability and location; seconded by Commissioner Gertson; 5 ayes 0 nays; motion carried, it was so ordered.**

**(See Attachments)**

**MINUTES OF THE COLORADO COUNTY  
COMMISSIONER'S COURT REGULAR MEETING**

**April 11, 2022**

**BID TABULATION FOR CULVERTS  
OPENED PUBLICLY APRIL 4, 2022 AT 2:00 P.M.  
FOR THE PERIOD APRIL 1, 2022 TO MARCH 31, 2023**

**(1) Galvanized Corrugated Steel Pipe (Price per linear foot)**

Bidder	Dia	2-2/3x1/2 10 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 12 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 14 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 16 Gage	Delivery Charge
Wilson Culverts	12	NB	NB	\$18.90	\$15.71	No charge
	15	NB	NB	\$23.63	\$19.53	
	18	NB	\$38.93	\$28.31	\$23.40	
	24	NB	\$50.09	\$37.44	\$31.19	
	30	NB	\$62.69	\$46.98	\$39.06	
	36	NB	\$76.28	\$56.25	\$47.25	
	48	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	54	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	60	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	72	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	84	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	96	NB	NB	NB	NB	

Bidder	Dia	2-2/3x1/2 10 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 12 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 14 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 16 Gage	Delivery Charge
Contech Constr	12	NB	NB	\$23.88	\$20.50	Call plant for
	15	NB	NB	\$29.85	\$24.60	Prices for freight
	18	NB	NB	\$35.82	\$30.75	(979) 743-4123
	24	NB	\$66.66	\$47.76	\$38.95	
	30	NB	\$82.82	\$59.70	\$49.20	
	36	\$124.62	\$98.98	\$71.64	\$59.45	
	48	\$164.82	\$131.30	\$95.52	\$77.90	
	54	\$213.06	\$147.46	\$107.46	NB	
	60	\$237.18	\$163.62	NB	NB	
	72	\$281.40	NB	NB	NB	
	84	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	96	NB	NB	NB	NB	

**MINUTES OF THE COLORADO COUNTY  
COMMISSIONER'S COURT REGULAR MEETING  
April 11, 2022**

Bidder	Dia	2-2/3x1/2 10 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 12 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 14 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 16 Gage	Delivery Charge
	12					
	15					
	18					
	24					
	30					
	36					
	48					
	54					
	60					
	72					
	84					
	96					

(2) Galvanized Corrugated Steel Pipe (Price per linear foot)

Bidder	Dia	3x1 or 5x1 10 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 12 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 14 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 16 Gage	Delivery Charge
<b>Wilson Culverts</b>	36	NB	NB	NB	NB	No charge
	48	\$154.80	\$120.92	\$89.60	\$75.06	
	54	\$174.20	\$136.40	\$101.43	\$84.42	
	60	\$193.46	\$149.27	\$110.39	\$92.75	
	72	\$232.20	\$180.23	\$133.43	\$111.24	
	84	\$272.93	\$207.63	\$154.35	NB	
	96	\$309.51	\$238.32	\$175.95	NB	
	108	\$340.02	\$267.57	\$197.06	NB	
	120	\$377.82	\$291.42	NB	NB	
	132	\$415.62	NB	NB	NB	
	144	\$453.42	NB	NB	NB	

Bidder	Dia	3x1 or 5x1 10 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 12 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 14 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 16 Gage	Delivery Charge
<b>Contech Constr</b>	36	NB	NB	NB	NB	Call plant for
	48	NB	NB	NB	NB	Freight prices
	54	\$237.44	\$185.92	\$136.64	\$110.50	(979) 743-4123
	60	\$264.32	\$206.08	\$150.08	\$121.55	

**MINUTES OF THE COLORADO COUNTY  
COMMISSIONER'S COURT REGULAR MEETING**

**April 11, 2022**

	72	\$313.60	\$246.40	\$181.44	\$145.86	
	84	\$367.36	\$286.72	\$210.56	\$170.17	
	96	\$421.12	\$329.28	\$239.68	\$192.27	
	108	\$472.64	\$369.60	\$268.80	NB	
	120	\$524.16	\$409.92	\$300.16	NB	
	132	\$580.16	\$456.96	NB	NB	
	144	\$631.68	NB	NB	NB	

Bidder	Dia	3x1 or 5x1 10 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 12 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 14 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 16 Gage	Delivery Charge
	36					
	48					
	54					
	60					
	72					
	84					
	96					
	108					
	120					
	132					
	144					

<b>3. Arched Galvanized Corrugated Steel Pipe (Price per linear foot)</b>
---

Bidder	Round Inches	Arch Inches	10 Gage	12 Gage	14 Gage	16 Gage	Del.Chg.
Wilson Culverts	15	17x13	NB	NB	\$24.63	\$20.53	None
	18	21x15	NB	\$39.93	\$29.31	\$24.40	
	21	24x18	NB	\$46.18	\$34.03	\$28.27	
	24	28x20	NB	\$51.09	\$38.44	\$32.19	
	30	35x24	NB	\$63.69	\$47.98	\$40.06	
	36	42x29	NB	\$77.28	\$57.25	NB	
	48	53x41	NB	\$122.42	\$91.10	NB	
	54	60x46	NB	\$137.90	\$102.93	NB	
	60	66x51	NB	\$150.77	\$111.89	NB	

**MINUTES OF THE COLORADO COUNTY  
COMMISSIONER'S COURT REGULAR MEETING**

**April 11, 2022**

Bidder	Round Inches	Arch Inches	10 Gage	12 Gage	14 Gage	16 Gage	Del.Chg.
Contech Cons	15	17x13	NB	NB	\$34.31	\$28.28	Call
	18	21x15	NB	NB	\$41.47	\$35.34	(979)
	21	24x18	NB	\$67.33	\$48.03	\$40.06	743-4123
	24	28x20	NB	\$76.62	\$54.90	\$44.77	
	30	35x24	NB	\$95.20	\$68.62	\$56.55	
	36	42x29	\$143.29	\$113.77	\$82.34	\$68.33	
	48	53x41	\$189.45	\$150.92	\$109.79	\$89.54	
	54	60x46	\$244.90	\$169.49	\$123.52	NB	
	60	71x47	\$272.62	\$188.07	NB	NB	

**4. Aluminized Corrugated Steel Pipe (Price per linear foot)**

Bidder	Dia	2-2/3x1/2 10 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 12 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 14 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 16 Gage	Delivery Charge
Wilson Culverts	12	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	15	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	18	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	24	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	30	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	36	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	48	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	54	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	60	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	72	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	84	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	96	NB	NB	NB	NB	

Bidder	Dia	2-2/3x1/2 10 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 12 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 14 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 16 Gage	Delivery Charge
Contech Constr	12	NB	NB	\$28.68	\$24.10	Call plant at
	15	NB	NB	\$35.85	\$28.92	(979) 743-4123
	18	NB	NB	\$43.02	\$36.15	
	24	NB	\$78.21	\$57.36	\$45.79	
	30	NB	\$97.17	\$71.70	\$57.84	
	36	\$146.94	\$116.13	\$86.04	\$69.89	
	48	\$194.34	\$154.05	\$114.72	\$91.58	

**MINUTES OF THE COLORADO COUNTY  
COMMISSIONER'S COURT REGULAR MEETING**

**April 11, 2022**

	54	\$251.22	\$173.01	\$129.06	NB	
	60	\$279.66	\$191.97	NB	NB	
	72	\$331.80	NB	NB	NB	
	84	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	96	NB	NB	NB	NB	

Bidder	Dia	2-2/3x1/2 10 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 12 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 14 Gage	2-2/3x1/2 16 Gage	Delivery Charge
	12					
	15					
	18					
	24					
	30					
	36					
	48					
	54					
	60					
	72					
	84					
	96					

**5. Aluminized Corrugated Steel Pipe (Price per linear foot)**

Bidder	Dia	3x1 or 5x1 10 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 12 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 14 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 16 Gage	Delivery Charge
<b>Wilson Culverts</b>	36	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	48	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	54	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	60	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	72	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	84	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	96	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	108	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	120	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	132	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	144	NB	NB	NB	NB	

**MINUTES OF THE COLORADO COUNTY  
COMMISSIONER'S COURT REGULAR MEETING  
April 11, 2022**

Bidder	Dia	3x1 or 5x1 10 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 12 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 14 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 16 Gage	Delivery Charge
<b>Contech Constr</b>	36	NB	NB	NB	NB	<b>Call plant at (979) 743-4123</b>
	48	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	54	\$288.32	\$215.80	\$165.31	\$130.00	
	60	\$320.96	\$239.20	\$181.57	\$143.00	
	72	\$380.80	\$286.00	\$219.51	\$171.60	
	84	\$446.08	\$332.80	\$259.79	\$200.20	
	96	\$511.36	\$382.20	\$287.97	\$226.20	
	108	\$573.92	\$429.02	\$325.20	NB	
	120	\$636.48	\$475.80	\$363.14	NB	
	132	\$704.48	\$530.40	NB	NB	
	144	\$767.04	NB	NB	NB	

Bidder	Dia	3x1 or 5x1 10 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 12 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 14 Gage	3x1 or 5x1 16 Gage	Delivery Charge
	36					
	48					
	54					
	60					
	72					
	84					
	96					
	108					
	120					
	132					
	144					

<b>6. Reinforced Concrete Pipe</b>
------------------------------------

Bidder	Diameter "Inches"	Price per linear foot	Delivery Charge
<b>Wilson Culvers</b>	12	No bid	
	15	No bid	
	18	No bid	
	24	No bid	

**MINUTES OF THE COLORADO COUNTY  
COMMISSIONER'S COURT REGULAR MEETING**

**April 11, 2022**

	30	No bid	
	36	No bid	
	48	No bid	
	54	No bid	
	60	No bid	
	72	No bid	
	84	No bid	
	96	No bid	

Bidder	Diameter "Inches"	Price per linear foot	Delivery Charge
<b>Contech Construction</b>	12	No bid	
	15	No bid	
	18	No bid	
	24	No bid	
	30	No bid	
	36	No bid	
	48	No bid	
	54	No bid	
	60	No bid	
	72	No bid	
	84	No bid	
	96	No bid	

Bidder	Diameter "Inches"	Price per linear foot	Delivery Charge
	12		
	15		
	18		
	24		
	30		
	36		
	48		
	54		
	60		
	72		
	84		
	96		



**MINUTES OF THE COLORADO COUNTY  
COMMISSIONER'S COURT REGULAR MEETING**

**April 11, 2022**

<b>7. High Density Polyethylene (HDPE) Pipe</b>
---

Bidder	Diameter "Inches"	Price per linear foot	Delivery Charge
<b>Wilson Culverts</b>	12	No bid	
	15	No bid	
	18	No bid	
	24	No bid	
	30	No bid	
	36	No bid	
	48	No bid	
	54	No bid	
	60	No bid	

Bidder	Diameter "Inches"	Price per linear foot	Delivery Charge
<b>Contech Construction</b>	12	No bid	
	15	No bid	
	18	No bid	
	24	No bid	
	30	No bid	
	36	No bid	
	48	No bid	
	54	No bid	
	60	No bid	

Bidder	Diameter "Inches"	Price per linear foot	Delivery Charge
	12		
	15		
	18		
	24		
	30		
	36		
	48		
	54		
	60		

**MINUTES OF THE COLORADO COUNTY  
COMMISSIONER'S COURT REGULAR MEETING  
April 11, 2022**

(8) ARCHED ALUMINIZED CORRUGATED STEEL PIPE

Bidder	Round Inches	Arch Inches	10 Gage	12 Gage	14 Gage	16 Gage	Del.Chg.
Wilson Culverts	15	17x13	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	18	21x15	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	21	24x18	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	24	28x20	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	30	35x24	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	36	42x29	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	48	53x41	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	54	60x46	NB	NB	NB	NB	
	60	66x51	NB	NB	NB	NB	

	Round Inches	Arch Inches	10 Gage	12 Gage	14 Gage	16 Gage	Del.Chg.
Contech Constr	15	17x13	NB	NB	\$41.21	\$33.24	Call plant
	18	21x15	NB	NB	\$49.45	\$41.55	743- 4123
	21	24x18	NB	\$79.00	\$57.69	\$47.09	
	24	28x20	NB	\$89.90	\$65.73	\$52.63	
	30	35x24	NB	\$111.69	\$82.41	\$66.48	
	36	42x29	\$168.90	\$133.48	\$98.90	\$80.33	
	48	53x41	\$223.38	\$177.07	\$131.86	\$105.26	
	54	60x46	\$288.76	\$226.10	\$167.57	NB	
	60	71x47	\$321.45	\$250.62	\$184.06	NB	

Bidder	Round Inches	Arch Inches	10 Gage	12 Gage	14 Gage	16 Gage	Del.Chg.
	15	17x13					
	18	21x15					
	21	24x18					
	24	28x20					
	30	35x24					
	36	42x29					

**MINUTES OF THE COLORADO COUNTY  
COMMISSIONER'S COURT REGULAR MEETING  
April 11, 2022**

	<b>48</b>	<b>53x41</b>					
	<b>54</b>	<b>60x46</b>					
	<b>60</b>	<b>66x51</b>					