

**MINUTES OF THE COLORADO COUNTY  
COMMISSIONER'S COURT REGULAR MEETING**

**March 13, 2023**

- \_10. Award bid(s) for the purchase of the following for county precincts:**
- a. Road paving;**
  - b. AC-5 asphalt, AC-10 asphalt, CRS-2 emulsion, MC-30 road oil, and seal coat sealers or proven equal;**
  - c. Road materials;**
  - d. Herbicides; and**
  - e. Culverts.**

**Commissioner Neuendorff stated that on item 10a the two bidders were H & C Construction and K-C Lease (formerly Matagorda Construction & Materials). Of the two, H & C Construction had the lower bid.**

**Motion by Commissioner Neuendorff to award the bid for road paving to H & C Construction; seconded by Commissioner Wessels; 5 ayes 0 nays; motion carried; it was so ordered.**

**Motion by Commissioner Gertson on item 10b,10c, and 10d to accept all bids based on price, quality, location and availability; seconded by Commissioner Neuendorff; 5 ayes 0 nays; motion carried; it was so ordered.**

**Motion by Commissioner Neuendorff on item 10e to accept all bids based on price, quality, location and availability; seconded by Commissioner Gertson; 5 ayes 0 nays; motion carried; it was so ordered.**

**(See Attachment)**

**MINUTES OF THE COLORADO COUNTY  
COMMISSIONER'S COURT REGULAR MEETING**

**March 13, 2023**

**COLORADO COUNTY BIDS FOR WEED AND BRUSH CONTROL  
OPENED PUBLICLY MARCH 2, 2023  
FOR THE PERIOD APRIL 1, 2023 TO MARCH 31, 2024**

**(1) Herbicide, "Round-Up Pro", or proven equal**

	2-1/2 Gallons			30 Gallons	
	Del.	Picked Up		Del.	Picked Up
Nutrien Ag Solutions (Territory Mgr)	47.25	47.25		567.00	567.00
Nutrien Ag Solutions (VM Sales)	57.50	No Bid		690.00	No Bid
Nutrien Ag Solutions (crop consultant (Wharton))	25.00	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
Site One Landscaping	110.00	110.00	Pick up in Katy	1281.11	1281.11
Helena Ag	No Bid	45.11/gal	Pick up in Garwood	No Bid	No Bid
<b>Pickup Location</b>					

**(2) Arsenal, or proven equal**

	1 Quart		2-1/2 Gallons		15 Gallons	
	Del.	Picked Up	Del.	Picked up	Del.	Picked Up
Nutrien Ag Solutions (Territory Mgr)	31.50	31.50	191.75	191.75	1180.50	1180.50
Nutrien Ag Solutions (VM Sales)	No Bid	No Bid	200.00	No Bid	1200.00	No Bid
Nutrien Ag Solutions (crop consultant (Wharton))	No Bid	No Bid	75.00/gal	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Site One Landscaping	No Bid	No Bid	587.74	587.74	No Bid	No Bid
Helena Ag	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	72.00/gal	No Bid	No Bid
<b>Pickup Location</b>			Site one – Katy Helena - Garwood			

**(3) Herbicide, Pramital, or proven equal**

	1 Gallon		2-1/2 Gallons		Plant Location
	Del.	Picked Up	Del.	Picked up	
Nutrien Ag Solutions (Territory Mgr)	36.00	36.00	82.50	82.50	
Nutrien Ag Solutions (VM Sales)	No Bid	No Bid	97.50	No Bid	
Nutrien Ag Solutions (crop consultant (Wharton))	37.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Site One Landscaping	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
Helena Ag	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
<b>Pickup Location</b>					